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Informed consent was obtained from the patient included in this study.

A 49-year-old female patient was referred to our retina 
clinic because of a peripapillary vascular tumor detected 
during a routine eye examination. The fundus examina-
tion showed peripapillary grape-like clusters of dilated 
sac-like aneurysms filled with dark red blood (Figure 1A). 
Fundus fluorescein angiography revealed typical blood 
levels. There was plasma-erythrocytic separation was 
observed within some aneurysms because of pooling of 
the dye in the superior plasma (producing hyperfluo-
rescence) and inferior sedimented red blood cells (pro-
ducing hypofluorescence) (Figure 1B). Spectral-domain  
optical coherence tomography passing through the 
lesion showed grape-like bunches of hyporeflective ve-
sicular formations surrounded by a ring with a hyperre-
flective edge involving the inner retinal layers (Figure 1C).

Cavernous hemangiomas of the retina may follow 
the courses of major veins or manifest in the peripa-
pillary area with aneurysmal venules dilation. They 
may co-occur with cutaneous or central nervous system 
hemangiomas(1). They can be diagnosed using imaging 
results in combination with the distinctive appearance 
of the fundus(1)
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